
also the maximum, which is evident from the 
plot The Y-axis is, therefore, proportional to 
the impedance of the speaker 

Should non-polar electrolytic capacitors be 
available readily, then by all means they may 
be used in crossover networks However, as 
regards the ESR of the non-polar electrolytic, 
to my knowledge, the construction of a single 
piece non-polar electrolytic consists inter¬ 
nally of two polarised electrolytics, back-to- 
back in a single can. Therefore, unless the 
manufacturer is specifically making these 
capacitors with a low power factor for use in 
loudspeaker crossover networks, one would 
not expect there to be a difference in their 
ESR as compared to two electrolytic capaci¬ 
ty s placed back-to-back otherwise. 

Speed Control tor DC Motors 
Mr A Sehgal’s circuit idea on 1C Speed Gov¬ 
ernor for Small DC Motors (EFY, March'86) is 
very interesting But the circuit described is a 
mere voltage regulator and will not be suitable 
for governing the speed against ‘load varia¬ 
tions' on the motor shaft 

This can be achieved only by a feedback 
arrangement in the circuit about the load level 
and correcting the input accordingly. All 
cassette recorder motors which use elec¬ 
tronic speed governors operate on this princi¬ 
ple There are standard ICs available for this 
purpose 

Being the first and the only one in India to 
make 1C governed motors, we have done 
enough studies in this area of design. Such 

micro motors, with built-in 1C speed gover¬ 
nors, are readily available in the Indian 
market. 

N. VENKATARAMANt 
Product Manager 

Rangam Electronics Ltd 
Madras 

The author, Mr A. Sehgal, replies: 
i gave a simple circuit for speed control of 
small DC motors. In this also speed will not 
change, regardless of load, when final setting 
using preset is done. More theory was not 
given as this was just a useful circuit idea,not a 
complete article on speed control. 

I am well aware of special ICs available for 
the purpose, but their cost prohibits their use 
by common hobbyists. 

As a low-cost control, this circuit is very 
handy for common hobbyists. It is not meant 
tor industrial applications. 

Computer Languagas 
Mr R. Ramaswamy’s articles on Comparative 
Study of Computer Languages' is really 
wonderful1 It has helped me a lot in knowing 
the difference between the various languages 
and has given me a clear understanding. 

However, there was a mistake in the Feb. '86 
issue. On page 63. under the subheading 
‘Library Functions in basic against LEN (X$), 
if X$ is "R. KRISHNANthen LENX$ will 
return 10 and not 11, including the period 
after R Please correct the error. 

I'm always eagerly waiting for the next issue 

to go through this particular topic. 
SANTOSH ARVIND 

Cochin 
The author, Mr R. Ramaawamy, replies: 
The value of X$ is “R. KRISHNAN". There is a 
blank after the period (stop). But in the actual 
print it is not clearly brought out since R. 
occurs in the first line and KRISHNAN occurs 
in the next line. If there is no space between 
the period and KRISHNAN, the value of 
LEN(X$) is 10. If the space is taken into 
account then LEN(X$) is 11. 
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